

Bid No. 18-01, Conductor
Bids Due January 17, 2017 at 2:00 p.m.

Bidder	Overhead Service Conductor			Overhead Primary Conductor		Underground Service Conductor		Underground Distribution Primary Conductor	
	#4 Al. Duplex, Terrier	#2 Al. Triplex, Conch	#1/0 Al. Triplex, Janthina	#2 ACSR Sparate	#1/0 ACSR Raven	4/0-2/0-4/0 Stranded Al. Triplex, Sweet Briar	350-4/0-350 MCM Stranded Al. Triplex, Wesleyan	#2 Stranded Al. 15 kV URD	#1/0 Stranded Al. 15kV URD
	1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8	9
Engineer's Estimate	\$350.00/mft	\$621.00/mft	\$898.00/mft	\$174.00/Cwt	\$161.00/Cwt	\$1425.00/Mft	\$2205.00/Mft	\$1811.00/mft	\$2371.00/mft
General Pacific bidding Nehring	\$325.00 16-18 weeks	\$579.00 16-18 weeks	\$742.00	\$150.00 10-12 weeks	\$145.83 10-12 weeks	\$1,299.00 16-18 weeks	\$2,229.00 16-18 weeks	No Bid	No Bid
General Pacific bidding Hendrix	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,604.56 2-4 weeks	\$2,163.10 2-4 weeks
WESCO bidding Nehring	\$298.00 16-18 weeks	No bid	\$718.00 16-18 weeks	\$155.00 11-14 weeks	\$153.00 10-13 weeks	No bid	No bid	No Bid	No Bid
WESCO bidding CME	No Bid	\$543.00 3-4 weeks	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,113.00 3-4 weeks	\$1,898.00 3-4 weeks	\$1,558.00 11-14 weeks	\$2,310.00 11-14 weeks

Bids are under review until January 23, 2018