

Bid No. 17-02, Conductor
Bids Due January 19, 2017 at 1:00 p.m.

Bidder	Overhead Service Conductor				Overhead Primary Conductor		Underground Service Conductor			Underground Distribution Primary Conductor	
	#4 Al. Duplex, Terrier	#2 Al. Triplex, Conch	#1/0 Al. Triplex, Janthina	#1/0 Al. Quadruplex, Standardbred	#2 ACSR Sparate	#1/0 ACSR Raven	2/0-1-2/0 Stranded Al. Triplex, Converse	4/0-2/0-4/0 Stranded Al. Triplex, Sweet Briar	350-4/0-350 MCM Stranded Al. Triplex, Wesleyan	#2 Stranded Al. 15 kV URD	#1/0 Stranded Al. 15kV URD
	1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8	9	10	11
Engineer's Estimate	\$390/1000 ft	\$515/1000 ft	\$375/1000 ft	\$780/1000 ft	\$155/100 lb	\$145/100 lb	\$850/1000 ft	\$1,265/ 1000 ft	\$2,000/1000 ft	\$1,500/1000 ft	\$2,000/1000 ft
Anixter bidding General Cable	\$311.00 2 weeks	\$653.59 2 weeks	\$778.83 2 weeks	\$1,297.20 2 weeks	\$158.17 2 weeks	\$148.15 2 weeks	\$978.34 2 weeks	\$1,210.04 2 weeks	\$1,969.87 2 weeks	\$1,468.45 13 weeks	\$1,994.74 13 weeks
General Pacific bidding Prysmian	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$939.50 3-6 weeks	\$1,365.00 3-6 weeks	\$2,187.34 3-6 weeks	\$1,457.00 8-12 weeks	\$1,897.34
General Pacific bidding General Cable	\$308.84 stock-6 weeks	\$592.25 stock-6 weeks	\$732.79 stock-6 weeks	No Bid	\$147.99 stock-6 weeks	\$147.54 stock-6 weeks	\$953.34 stock-6 weeks	\$1,277.50 stock-6 weeks	\$2,045.70 stock-6 weeks	\$1,516.99 stock-15 weeks	\$2,060.70 stock-15 weeks
General Pacific bidding Hendrix	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,449.00 2-6 weeks	\$1,936.54 2-6 weeks
General Pacific bidding Nehring	\$258.91 16-18 weeks	\$497.12 16-18 weeks	\$719.78 16-18 weeks	\$1,242.80 16-18 weeks	\$139.80 10-12 weeks	\$129.44 10-12 weeks	\$959.00 16-18 weeks	\$1,273.85 16-18 weeks	\$2,216.30 16-18 weeks	No Bid	No Bid
General Pacific bidding Southwire	\$287.99 6-8 weeks	\$535.00 6-8 weeks	\$726.44 6-8 weeks	\$900.32 2-8 weeks	\$138.40 stock-10 weeks	\$134.85 stock-10 weeks	\$885.39 stock-10 weeks	\$1,140.94 6-8 weeks	\$1,764.38 6-8 weeks	\$1,484.66 stock-11 weeks	\$1,889.11 stock-11 weeks

Bids are under review. It is expected that a recommendation to the Commissioner of Lewis County PUD will be presented during their regularly scheduled meeting on January 24, 2017.